BID SUMMARY

Packagce 1 — Electrical Supplies, Conduit, Conduit Accessories.

Wire, Poles, and Fixtures

BID NO. 605883-21

BIDS RECEIVED

Bid Amounts

Vegas Electric Supply Inc. (NBE) $547,628.02
Sun Valley Electric Supply (NBE) $613,590.80
Main Electric Supply Company, LLC (NBE) $700,474.45
Nedco Supply (NBE) $720,804.57
Graybar Electric Company (NBE) $897,376.77

Package 2 — Square D Products Breakers, Disconnects and Load Centers

BIDS RECEIVED Annual Award Amount % Discount Offered
Graybar Electric Company (NBE) $30,000.00 70%

Sun Valley Electric Supply (NBE) $30,000.00 55%
Vegas Electric Supply Inc. (NBE) $30,000.00 50%
Nedco Supply (NBE) No Bid
Main Electric Supply Company, LLC (NBE) No Bid

Package 3 — GE Products Breakers, Disconnects and Load Centers

BIDS RECEIVED Annual Award Amount % Discount Offered
Sun Valley Electric Supply (NBE) $30,000.00 60%
Vegas Electric Supply Inc. (NBE) $30,000.00 40%
Nedco Supply (NBE) $30,000.00 10%

Main Electric Supply Company, LLC (NBE) No Bid
Graybar Electric Company (NBE) No Bid
Package 4 — Siemens Products Breakers, Disconnects and Load Centers

BIDS RECEIVED Annual Award Amount % Discount Offered
Main Electric Supply Company, LLC (NBE) $30,000.00 899,

Sun Valley Electric Supply (NBE) $30,000.00 50%
Vegas Electric Supply Inc. (NBE) $30,000.00 40%
Nedco Supply (NBE) $30,000.00 10%
Graybar Electric Company (NBE) No Bid

Packave 5 — Cutler Hammer Breakers, Disconnects and Load Centers

BIDS RECEIVED Annual Award Amount % Discount Offered
Main Electric Supply Company, LLC (NBE) $30,000.00 899,
Vegas Electric Supply Inc. (NBE) $30,000.00 55%

Sun Valley Electric Supply (NBE) $30,000.00 45%,
Nedco Supply (NBE) No Bid
Graybar Electric Company (NBE) No Bid
Package 6 — ITE Products Breakers, Disconnects and Load Centers

BIDS RECEIVED Annual Award Amount % Discount Offered
Main Electric Supply Company, LLC (NBE) $30,000.00 89
Vegas Electric Supply Inc. (NBE) $30,000.00 50%

Sun Valley Electric Supply (NBE) $30,000.00 50%,
Nedco Supply (NBE) $30,000.00 10%
Graybar Electric Company (NBE) No Bid
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BID SUMMARY

Package 7 — Variable Frequency Drives

BID NO. 605883-21

BIDS RECEIVED Annual Award Amount % Discount Offered
Main Electric Supply Company, LLC (NBE) $30,000.00 62%
Vegas Electric Supply Inc. (NBE) $30,000.00 40%

Sun Valley Electric Supply (NBE) $30,000.00 25%,
Nedco Supply (NBE) $30,000.00 10%
Graybar Electric Company (NBE) No Bid

Package 8 — Variable Frequency Drives - Mitsubishi

BIDS RECEIVED

Annual Award Amount

% Discount Offered

Main Electric Supply Company, LLC (NBE) $30,000.00 40%
Vegas Electric Supply Inc. (NBE) $30,000.00 40%*
Sun Valley Electric Supply (NBE) $30,000.00 25%
Nedco Supply (NBE) $30,000.00 10%
Graybar Electric Company (NBE) No Bid

*Vegas Electric Supply Inc. is being recommended for rejection and is considered non-responsible for package eight

(8) for not being a local authorized distributor.

Packaue 9 — Variable Frequency Drives — Yaskawa

BIDS RECEIVED Annual Award Amount % Discount Offered
Vegas Electric Supply Inc. (NBE) $30,000.00 60%*

Sun Valley Electric Supply (NBE) $30,000.00 30%

Main Electric Supply Company, LLC (NBE) No Bid
Nedco Supply (NBE) No Bid
Graybar Electric Company (NBE) No Bid

*Vegas Electric Supply Inc. is being recommended for rejection and is considered non-responsible for package nine

(9) for not being a local authorized distributor.

Package 10 — Variable Frequency Drives - Allen Bradley / Rockwell Automation

BIDS RECEIVED

Annual Award Amount

% Discount Offered

Vegas Electric Supply Inc. (NBE) $30,000.00 50%%*
Sun Valley Electric Supply (NBE) $30,000.00 20%

Main Electric Supply Company, LLC (NBE) No Bid
Nedco Supply (NBE) No Bid
Graybar Electric Company (NBE) No Bid

*Vegas Electric Supply Inc. is being recommended for rejection and is considered non-responsible for package ten

(10) for not being a local authorized distributor.
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