Package 1 — The Hon Company

BID SUMMARY

BID NO. 605966-21

BIDS RECEIVED Annual Award Amount % Discount Offered
Creative Design Studio LLC (WBE) $435,000.00 55.0%
Staples Business Advantage (NBE) $435,000.00 52.2%
American Filing Solutions (NBE) $435,000.00 18.0%
Machabee Office Environments (NBE) $435,000.00 No Bid
Henriksen Butler Nevada (NBE) $435,000.00 No Bid
Package 2 - KI

BIDS RECEIVED Annual Award Amount % Discount Offered
Machabee Office Environments (NBE) $435,000.00 50.0%
Henriksen Butler Nevada (NBE) $435,000.00 49.0%
Staples Business Advantage (NBE) $435,000.00 45.0%
American Filing Solutions (NBE) $435,000.00 No Bid
Creative Design Studio LLC (NBE) $435,000.00 No Bid
Package 3 — Kimball Office Furniture

BIDS RECEIVED Annual Award Amount % Discount Offered
Machabee Office Environments (NBE) $435,000.00 59.0%
Henriksen Butler Nevada (NBE) $435,000.00 56.0%
Staples Business Advantage (NBE) $435,000.00 55.0%
American Filing Solutions (NBE) $435,000.00 No Bid
Creative Design Studio LLC (NBE) $435,000.00 No Bid
Package 4 — National Office Furniture

BIDS RECEIVED Annual Award Amount % Discount Offered
Machabee Office Environments (NBE) $435,000.00 59.0%
Henriksen Butler Nevada (NBE) $435,000.00 56.0%
Staples Business Advantage (NBE) $435,000.00 55.0%
American Filing Solutions (NBE) $435,000.00 No Bid
Creative Design Studio LLC (NBE) $435,000.00 No Bid
Package 5 — VIA Seating

BIDS RECEIVED Annual Award Amount % Discount Offered
Machabee Office Environments (NBE) $435,000.00 58.0%*
Henriksen Butler Nevada (NBE) $435,000.00 58.0%
Staples Business Advantage (NBE) $435,000.00 45.0%
American Filing Solutions (NBE) $435,000.00 No Bid
Creative Design Studio LLC (NBE) $435,000.00 No Bid

*The low bid for package 5 was determined by a public drawing performed by the Clark County
Clerk’s Office in accordance with Instructions to Bidders, section 25, Tie Bids.
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