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DFS Contracts

From: Mari Parlade
Sent: Wednesday, March 23, 2022 9:52 AM
To: Cora Rosario; Rajnesh Narayan; DFS Fiscal Services; DFS Contracts
Cc: Michelle Tobler; Crystalyn Minwegen-Johannessohn; Judy Tudor
Subject: BCC APPROVAL & IMMEDIATE PAYMENT: Appeal Hearing Decision and Invoices for 

Attachments: Invoice letter B.pdf; Invoice letter.pdf; Tobler Invoice  Approved MDP.pdf

Good morning Cora & Fiscal Team, 
 
Our Hearing Officer Michelle Tobler rendered a total of 13.1 hours to prepare for, convene & issue a decision on a Fair 
Hearing. I can attest that these services were justified and necessary in that multiple witnesses testified at the Hearing 
thereby requiring a lengthy Decision to assess credibility of every witness as well as the plethora of documentary 
evidence that was submitted for consideration. I have approved Invoice A which for the maximum of 10.0 hours.  The 
remaining balance of 3.1 hours will need to be submitted to the BCC for approval of Invoice B.  For your reference, we 
have also attached Invoice Letter which includes the total hours and the Hearing Officer’s justification pursuant to Clark 
County Code 2.68.060.   
 
I fully support making our Hearing Officer whole by compensating her for all services rendered on behalf of the children 
and families we serve. I thank you in advance for expediting this for BCC approval.  Meanwhile, Fiscal Team please 
process payment for the 10.0 hours.   
 
Please let me know if there is anything more we can do. Thank you! 
 
MARI D. PARLADE, ESQUIRE  
Legal & Strategic Initiatives Manager 
Clark County Department of Family Services 
500 S. Grand Central Parkway, 5th Floor 
Las Vegas, Nevada 89155 
 

From: Michelle Tobler   
Sent: Tuesday, March 8, 2022 6:32 PM 
To: Crystalyn Minwegen-Johannessohn >; DFS Appeals 

 
Subject: Appeal Hearing Decision and Invoices for  
 
Dear Crystalyn, 
 
Attached please find the Appeal Hearing Decision for the  matter.  I apologize for the delay in getting this to 
you.  My computer crashed last week, and I was having difficulty recovering documents. 
 
Also attached are three invoices for this matter as I exceeded the allotted 10 hours in this case: Invoice A, Invoice B to be 
sent to the board for anticipated approval, and the original invoice. 
 
Thank you, 
 
Michelle O. Tobler, Esq. 
Law Offices of Michelle O. Tobler, Ltd.  
6955 N. Durango Dr., Ste. 1115  
Las Vegas, NV 89149  
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