DFS Contracts

From: Mari Parlade

Sent: Tuesday, April 5, 2022 3:59 PM

To: Rajnesh Narayan; Cora Rosario; DFS Fiscal Services; DFS Contracts

Cc: Michelle Tobler; Crystalyn Minwegen-Johannessohn; DFS Appeals

Subject: IMMEDIATE PAYMENT & BCC AGENDA: Appeal Hearing Decision and Invoices for
; Case No.

Attachments: Invoice letter.pdf; Invoice letter B.pdf; Invoice letter A MDP.pdf

Good afternoon Cora, Raj, Fiscal & Contracts Team.

Please assist me with: (1) rendering immediate payment on Invoice A and (2) placing payment of Invoice B
before BCC for approval pursuant to Clark County Code 2.68.060.

Hearing Officer Michelle Tobler expended a total of 12.8 hours to prepare for, preside over and render a
Decision on the Hearing. These services were justified and necessary. As a result, she is entitled to
compensation totaling $896.00. In efforts to compensate Ms. Tobler for her services, | have signed and
approved payment of Invoice A for 10.0 hours totaling $700.00. Please facilitate payment for Invoice A.

Meanwhile, as to the remaining balance of $196.00, please place this before the BCC for approval. For your
reference, please utilize Invoice B wherein Ms. Tobler states, in accordance with Clark County Code 2.68.060,
that: “The services provided were justified

and necessary in this matter where there was voluminous documentary evidence containing multiple
statements given by several witnesses on different occasions. The Decision on the hearing was 9 pages long
due to the analysis required of the various witness statements.”

Let me know if there is anything | can do to facilitate this. I've included Ms. Tobler on this email. Thank you in
advance for your follow through on this.

MARI D. PARLADE, ESQUIRE

Legal & Strategic Initiatives Manager

Clark County Department of Family Services
500 S. Grand Central Parkway, 5th Floor

Las Vegas, Nevada 89155

From: DFS Appeals

Sent: Tuesday, April 5, 2022 3:42 PM

To: Mari Parlade

Cc: Crystalyn Minwegen-Johannessohn

Subject: Appeal Hearing Decision and Invoices for ; Case No

Good Afternoon,

Attached are three Invoices, will you please sign the attached invoice for Tobler? | will send the invoice to Fiscal for
processing after you sign. Thank you.



Thank you,

Ingrid Ketring

Clark County Department of Family Services-
Appeals Department- Legal Unit

500 S. Grand Central Pkwy. 5% floor

Las Vegas, NV 89155

From: Michelle Tobler
Sent: Tuesday, April 5, 2022 3:11 PM
To: Crystalyn Minwegen-Johannessohn

Subject: Appeal Hearing Decision and Invoices for ; Case No.

Dear Crystalyn,

Attached please find the Appeal Hearing Decision and Invoices for the
have attached three Invoices as | exceeded the 10 hour limit.

Thank you,

Michelle O. Tobler, Esq.

Law Offices of Michelle O. Tobler, Ltd.
6955 N. Durango Dr., Ste. 1115

Las Vegas, NV 89149

DFS Appeals

; Case No.

matter.





